DOWNERS GROVE PARK DISTRICT

Bid Opening Minutes

Seasonal Recreation and Parks Guide and Quarterly Newsletter

Present

Visitors

Bid Opening

October 8, 2008
2:00 PM

Administrator Dan Cermak; Public Information Supervisor Brandi Nice:

Clerk Regina Ozog; Clerk Debbie Bender.

Lauren Kush - R.R. Donnelley

* * * *

Administrator Cermak opened the sealed bids for Seasonal
Recreation and Parks Guide and Quarterly Newsletter and the
following bids were read aloud:

(See Attached)

Administrator Cermak stated Staff would review the bids and
compile the data for a recommendation to the Board of Park
Commissioners at their Regular Meeting on November 6, 2008, to
be held at the Village Hall Council Chambers, 801 Burlington,
Downers Grove, IL.

Administrator Cermak thanked the visitors for attending and for their
time and effort in preparing the bids.



DOWNERS GROVE PARK DISTRICT

Bid Opening

Seasonal Recrealion & Parks Guide & Quarterly Newsletier

October 8, 2008

[ _
Submitted By:
Guide Series One Series of Quarterly Newsletters
1 Year Opt. _N Year Opt. |3 Year Opt. Add Alternative 1 Year Option 2009-2010 1 Year Opt. _m Year Opt. |3 Year Opt. Add Alternate Alternate Bid
4 issues 12 issues Opt. 1 Opt. 2 Opt. 3 Opt. 4 4 issues 8 issues 12 issues 1 Year Opi. 2009 4 Year Opt. 2009
1. Action Printing $46,186.00| $46,186.00| $47,112.00 Add $1388 |Add $2702 $50.00|subtract $427 | $7,400.00] $7,400.00| $7,548.00 Same $2,621.00
Fond Du Lac, WI 54937
_ [
2. Gravity Graphics, Inc. No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid $6,500.00f No Bid No Bid $7,200.00 $13,500.00
27W230 Beecher Avenue
Winfield, IL 60190
I [
3. Strathmore Company $64,175.00{ $66,110.00[ $68,090.00 $6,960.00{ $1,650.00 $78.34 No Bid $7.820.00( $8,060.00{ $8,300.00 No Bid $3,270.00
2000 Gary Lane
Geneva, IL 60134
[ _
4. Hagg Press $56,035.00{ $58,836.00{ $61,778.00 $7,5600.00| $10,340.00] $235.00[ $56,035.00| $6,036.00| $6,338.00| $6,655.00 $6,036.00 $10,300.00
1165 Jansen Farm Court
Elgin, IL 60123
[ [
5. Caslle-Printech $36,660.00| $38,500.00] $40,425.00 $13,990.00] $1,725.00 $36.00 Add 7% $7.800.00] $8,200.00| $8,620.00 Included $3,755.00
121 Induslrial Drive
Dekalb, IL 60115
[ _
6. R.R. Donnelly $60,962.55| No Bid No Bid $19,5637.51| $20,100.86| $296.64 $18,917.46] $8,364.00] No Bid No Bid $2,091.00 $3,805.00
_

_




