Present

Visitors

Bid Opening

DOWNERS GROVE PARK DISTRICT

Bid Opening Minutes
2008 Vehicles
December 4, 2007
2:00 PM

Administrator Dan Cermak, Director of Parks Todd Reese, Parks
Foreman Len Fisher, Parks Brett Kohnen, Clerk Debbie Bender.

John Prell — Packey Webb Ford

* * * *

Administrator Cermak opened the sealed bids for the Downers
Grove Park District 2008 Vehicles.

The following bids were open and read aloud.
(See attached)

Administrator Cermak stated Staff would review the bids and
compile the data for a recommendation to the Board of Park
Commissioners at their Regular Meeting on December 20, 2007,
to be held at the Village Hall Council Chambers, 801 Burlington
Avenue, Downers Grove, IL.

Administrator Cermak thanked the visitor for attending and for the
time and effort in preparing the bids.



DOWNERS GROVE PARK DISTRICT BID OPENING - 2008 VEHICLES

December 4, 2007

1-Ton Work Van (Cargo) |4X4 Pick Up Truck F250XL |4X4 Pick Up Truck F250XL |4X4 Crew Cab & Alt. #1 Passenger Van 4X4 Utility Vehicle
2-WD JE350 Super Duty [Super Cab/2500HD Ext. Cab/2500HD Chassis F350 XL Add. Cost |T & C Grand Jeep Wrangler X
Commerciall Extended Cab Extended Cab 4X4 3500 HD for Diesel |Caravan/ Equinox Series (Hardtop)
Express 3500 Work Van |[Work Truck Short Bed Work Truck Lq Bed Work _ Truck
BUDGET $17,000 $24,000 $24,000 $26,000 $18,000 $25,000
VENDOR Trade Net Trade Net Trade Net Trade Net Trade Net Trade Net
1. Mike Haggerty Pontiac
9301 S. Cicero Ave.
Oak Lawn, IL 60453 $1,000 *§$16,967.00 |$2,500 $22,415.00 [$1,000 $23,826.00 |$3,500 $22,713.00 No Bid $1,000 $18,550.00 |$500 * $17,313.00
2. Sutton Ford
21315 Central Ave.
Matleson, IL 60443 $2,000 $19.432.00 |$2,500 $21,010.00 [$2,000 $21.638.00 |$4,100 $24,710.00 $5,722.00 {$1,300 $22.671.00 $20,978.00
3. Castle Buick-Pontiac GMC $24,073.00
7400 W. Cermak Road Crew Seat 717.00
North Riverside, IL 80546 $2,000 $24,790.00 |$2,000 $28.048.00 [$2,000 $28,377.00 No Bid No Bid $1,000 $20,578.00 No Bid
4. Packey Webb Ford
2150 W. Ogden Ave.
Downers Grove, IL 60515 $1,600 $19,400.00 |$3,000 $19,400.00 [$2,000 $20,315.00 (87,000 $21,450.00 $5,660.00 No Bid No Bid
5. Village Pontiac-GMC
1585 W. Ogden Ave,
Naperville, IL 60540 No Bid $500 $24,617.00 8500 $24,878.48 No Bid No Bid No Bid No Bid
6. Ron Westphal Chevrolet
1425 West Ogden Ave.
Oswego/Aurora, IL 60504 $1,600 $19,973.10 |$3,000 $21,444.80 |$B00 $24,208.28 |$9,300 $19,392.98 No Bid $1,100 $18,513.73 No Bid
“"Non-Compliant Vehicle




