Present

Visitors

Bid Opening

DOWNERS GROVE PARK DISTRICT

Bid Opening Minutes

Printing of 2007/2008 Leisure Guides and Newsletters

January 9, 2007
2:00 PM

Administrator Dan Cermak, Director of Recreation Elsa Fischer, Public
Information Supervisor Bill Pearch, Clerk Debbie Bender.

Kevin Fazm — the Printing System; Dean Knowles — Rochelle Printing Co.;
Chris Swing — United Graphics, Inc.; Jeff Carpenter — P & P Press; Vance
Malley — Castle Printech;

* % * *

Administrator Cermak opened the sealed bids for Printing of the
District’s Leisure Guide Series and Publications

Fourteen bids were received and attached is a list showing details
for each bid.

Administrator Cermak stated Staff would review the bids and
compile the data for a recommendation to the Board of Park
Commissioners at their Regular Meeting on January 18, 2007, to be
held at the Downers Grove Village Council Chambers.

Administrator Cermak thanked the visitors for attending and for their
time and effort in preparing the bids.



DOWNERS GROVE PARK DISTRICT

Bid Opening

Printing of Park District Leisure Guides and Newsletters for 2007/2008

January 9, 2007

SUBMITTED BY:

Leisure Guide Series

BASE PROPOSAL TOTALS FOR:
I

Newsletters

1 Year

2 Year

1 Year

2 Year

Hagg Press

$60,660.00

$62,478.00

$6,128.00

$6,308.00

1165 Jansen Farm Court

Elgin, 1L 60123

Hi-Liter Graphics, LLC

$40,191.00

$40,191.00

$10,500.00

$10,500.00

700 Blackhawk Drive

Burlington, WI 53105

United Graphics Incorporated

$59,276.79

No Bid

$11,455.88

No Bid

2916 Marshall Avenue

Mattoon, IL 61938

P & P Press

$40,545.00

$43,788.00 |

$11,196.00

$12,092.00

6513 N. Galena Road

Peoria, IL 81614

Crescent Printing Company

$39,660.00

No Bid

$6,860.00

No Bid

1001 Commercial Court

|Onalaska, Wi 54650

Action Printing

$41,199.00

$82,398.00

$8,968.00

$17,936.00

N6637 Rolling Meadows Drive

‘Fond Du Lac, Wl 54837

M & D Prinfing

$51,768.00

$52,794.00

$8,292.00

$8,386.00

515 University Avenue

Henry, IL 61537

Profoerma

$39,270.00

$34,500.00

$5,860.00

$5,180.00

810 West Pioneer Parkway

Peoria, IL 61615

Strathmore Company

$40,254.00

$37,838.00

$6.,132.00

$5,764.00

2000 Gary Lane

Geneva, IL 60134

10.

Teleprint

No Bid

No Bid

$5,140.00

$5,140.00

471 W. Fullerton Avenue

Elmhurst, IL 60126




DOWNERS GROVE PARK DISTRICT

Bid Opening

Printing of Park District Leisure Guides and Newsletters for 2007/2008

January 9, 2007

BASE PROPOSAL TOTALS FOR:

SUBMITTED BY: Leisure Guide Series Newsletters
1 Year 2 Year 1 Year X 2 Year
11.| |Castle PrinTech $32,925.00 $65,850.00 $7,200.00 |  $14.400.00
121 Industrial Drive F
DeKalb, IL 60115 !
12.||Rochelle Printing $46,022.34 $47,581.92 $5,974.96 $6,154.70
600 South 7th Street
Rochelle, IL 61068
13.| | The Printing System No Bid No Bid 1 $3,500.00 $3,300.00
10 N. Martingale Road, Suite 400
Schaumburg, IL 60173
14. | |Spinnaker Litho Corp. $59,260.00 $121,910.00 $11,800.00 $24,200.00
11 West Park Blvd.
Villa Park, 1L 60181
15,
16,
17.
18,
19,

20.




